BID COMPARISON
Lewisburg Cumberland Street Phase 3
Village of Lewisburg, Ohio

Bid Date: June 2, 2011 at 11:00 A.M.
Prepared: June 2, 2011

Engi 's Estimate: Roadway $250,000.00 / MBE Supplier $3,000.00
#1 #2 #3 #4 #5 #6 #7 #8 #9 #10
CA Shindeldecker R.A. Miller Arcon Builders CK Excavating W.G. Stang Barrett Paving Materials Brumbaugh Construction Durst Bros. Excavating C.G. Construction & Utilities Prograde Excavation

ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT | UNIT COSTl TOTAL COST | UNIT COST| TOTAL COST | UNIT COSTl TOTAL COST | UNIT COST| TOTAL COST | UNIT COST | TOTAL COST | UNIT COST | TOTAL COST [ UNIT COST | TOTAL COST | UNIT COST | TOTAL COST | UNIT COST | TOTAL COST | UNIT COST | TOTAL COST

ROADWAY
203 Excavation, Including Embankment 750 C.Y. $ 20.00 [ $ 15,000.00 | $ 40.00 [ $ 30,000.00 13.00 9,750.00 | $ 28.80 [ $ 21,600.00 | $ 20.00 [ $ 15,000.00 | $ 22.00 [$ 16,500.00 | $ 19.00 | $ 14,250.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 11,250.00 | $ 19.00 | $ 14,250.00 | $ 18.33 | $ 13,747.50
203 Excavation, Not Incl. Embkmt. (Subbase Failures) 20 C.Y. 10.00 200.00 60.00 1,200.00 12.00 240.00 17.50 350.00 20.00 400.00 39.00 780.00 10.00 200.00 50.00 1,000.00 12.00 240.00 26.53 530.60
203 Borrow, as per plan (used as Embankment) 100 C.Y. 25.00 2,500.00 45.00 4,500.00 16.00 1,600.00 27.30 2,730.00 20.00 2,000.00 116.19 11,619.00 12.00 1,200.00 50.00 5,000.00 19.00 1,900.00 36.49 3,649.00
203 Rock Excavation 50 C.Y. 10.00 500.00 95.00 4,750.00 20.00 1,000.00 42.50 2,125.00 10.00 500.00 52.00 2,600.00 87.00 4,350.00 75.00 3,750.00 65.00 3,250.00 88.30 4,416.50
204 |Subgrade Compaction 2,495 S.Y. 0.25 623.75 1.50 3,742.50 1.00 2,495.00 1.50 3,742.50 2.00 4,990.00 1.00 2,495.00 1.00 2,495.00 1.00 2,495.00 1.50 3,742.50 1.50 3,742.50
253 Pavement Repair 20 C.Y. 175.00 3,500.00 176.00 3,520.00 156.00 3,120.00 221.80 4,436.00 150.00 3,000.00 239.00 4,780.00 140.00 2,800.00 160.00 3,200.00 182.00 3,640.00 207.80 4,156.00
254  |Pavement Planing, Asphalt 500 S.Y. 7.50 3,750.00 7.00 3,500.00 12.00 6,000.00 14.00 7,000.00 10.00 5,000.00 12.10 6,050.00 10.00 5,000.00 15.00 7,500.00 7.25 3,625.00 8.01 4,005.00
301 Bituminous Aggregate Base 132 C.Y. 145.00 19,140.00 146.00 19,272.00 156.00 20,592.00 186.25 24,585.00 150.00 19,800.00 160.00 21,120.00 140.00 18,480.00 145.00 19,140.00 153.00 20,196.00 142.61 18,824.52
304  [4" Compacted Aggregate Base (Walks & Drives) 110 C.Y. 35.00 3,850.00 42.00 4,620.00 34.00 3,740.00 37.00 4,070.00 30.00 3,300.00 41.00 4,510.00 85.00 9,350.00 32.00 3,520.00 50.00 5,500.00 29.34 3,227.40
304 [6" Compacted Aggregate Base (Curbs) 95 C.Y. 40.00 3,800.00 45.00 4,275.00 33.00 3,135.00 44.00 4,180.00 30.00 2,850.00 43.00 4,085.00 85.00 8,075.00 40.00 3,800.00 50.00 4,750.00 29.34 2,787.30
304 [Compacted Aggregate Base (Street) 263 C.Y. 35.00 9,205.00 50.00 13,150.00 30.00 7,890.00 37.00 9,731.00 30.00 7,890.00 40.00 10,520.00 53.00 13,939.00 37.00 9,731.00 45.00 11,835.00 30.45 8,008.35
304 |Compacted Aggregate Base (Subbase Failures) 20 C.y. 35.00 700.00 50.00 1,000.00 30.00 600.00 37.00 740.00 30.00 600.00 68.00 1,360.00 60.00 1,200.00 40.00 800.00 26.00 520.00 32.34 646.80
304 |Gravel Drive Repair, as per plan 52 C.Y. 40.00 | $  2,080.00 42.00 2,184.00 11.00 | $ 572.00 37.00 1,924.00 30.00 [$ 1,560.00 45.00 2,340.00 85.00 [ $ 4,420.00 50.00 2,600.00 50.00 2,600.00 29.37 1,527.24
407 [Tack Coat @ 0.075 gal./S.Y. 71 GAL. 350 $ 248.50 2.80 198.80 5.00 | $ 355.00 3.00 213.00 2.00|$ 142.00 2.40 170.40 2.00|$ 142.00 4.00 284.00 3.00 213.00 4.91 348.61
448  [Asphalt Wedge, as per plan, Type 1 PG 64-22 50 C.Y. 135.00 [$  6,750.00 130.00 6,500.00 156.00 [ $  7,800.00 140.00 7,000.00 150.00 7,500.00 169.00 8,450.00 140.00 | $ 7,000.00 155.00 7,750.00 140.00 7,000.00 141.13 7,056.50
448  [Asphalt Drive Repair, as per plan, Type 1 PG 64-22 6 C.Y. 135.00 [ $ 810.00 250.00 1,500.00 156.00 | $ 936.00 178.00 1,068.00 150.00 900.00 862.00 5,172.00 140.00 | $ 840.00 175.00 1,050.00 140.00 840.00 141.13 846.78
448  [3" Asphalt Conc. Surface Course, Type 1 PG 64-22 80 C.Y. 135.00 | $ 10,800.00 130.00 10,400.00 156.00 | $ 12,480.00 134.00 10,720.00 150.00 12,000.00 170.00 13,600.00 140.00 | $ 11,200.00 165.00 13,200.00 140.00 11,200.00 141.13 11,290.40
452 [Concrete Drive Repair, as per plan 143 S.Y. 36.50 [$  5,219.50 52.00 7,436.00 48.00 | $  6,864.00 36.00 5,148.00 50.00 [$  7,150.00 62.50 8,937.50 3235($ 4,626.05 50.00 7,150.00 42.00 6,006.00 32.93 4,708.99
452 [Concrete Drive Apron 6" (Residential), as per plan 166 S.Y. 36.50 [$  6,059.00 56.50 9,379.00 48.00 | $  7,968.00 42.50 7,055.00 50.00 [$  8,300.00 62.50 10,375.00 3110 ($ 5,162.60 55.00 9,130.00 42.00 6,972.00 32.99 5,476.34
603 |4" Storm (Downspout Drain) Type E 200 L.F. 7.00 | $ 1,400.00 15.00 3,000.00 4.00 [ $ 800.00 15.00 3,000.00 8.00 |$ 1,600.00 10.00 2,000.00 5.00 | $ 1,000.00 15.00 3,000.00 7.00 1,400.00 7.93 1,586.00
603  |6" Storm Sewer HDPE, as per plan, in Lawn (Labor and Additional Material, No Pipe) 45 L.F. 7.00 | $ 315.00 18.00 810.00 18.00 | $ 810.00 18.20 819.00 8.00 % 360.00 10.90 490.50 19.00 | $ 855.00 30.00 1,350.00 24.00 1,080.00 8.44 379.80
603  |12" Storm Sewer HDPE, as per plan, in Street (Labor and Additional Material, No Pipe) 37 L.F. 21.00 [ $ 777.00 60.00 2,220.00 95.00 [$  3,515.00 41.00 1,517.00 40.00 | $  1,480.00 22.00 814.00 52.00 | $ 1,924.00 70.00 2,590.00 35.00 1,295.00 34.21 1,265.77
603  |12" Storm Sewer RCP CL-IV, as per plan, in Street (Labor and Additional Material, No Pipe) 10 L.F. 26.00 [ $ 260.00 70.00 700.00 95.00 | $ 950.00 51.70 517.00 40.00 | $ 400.00 28.50 285.00 60.00 | $ 600.00 75.00 750.00 70.00 700.00 34.48 344.80
603 |12" Storm Sewer RCP CL-IV, as per plan, in Lawn (Labor and Additional Material, No Pipe) 200 L.F. 23.00 [$  4,600.00 52.00 10,400.00 43.00 | $ 8,600.00 19.24 3,848.00 25.00 [$ 5,000.00 27.00 5,400.00 28.00 [ $ 5,600.00 60.00 12,000.00 25.00 5,000.00 31.45 6,290.00
604 |Type 'D' Storm Inlet, as per plan 5 EACH 1,750.00 | $  8,750.00 2,200.00 11,000.00 1,728.00 | $  8,640.00 1,460.00 7,300.00 1,750.00 | $  8,750.00 2,400.00 12,000.00 1,750.00 | $ 8,750.00 1,800.00 9,000.00 1,600.00 8,000.00 1,088.76 5,443.80
604 |Type'Y' Storm Inlet, as per plan 1 EACH 1,850.00 | $  1,850.00 1,600.00 1,600.00 1,800.00 | $  1,800.00 1,800.00 1,800.00 1,750.00 1,750.00 2,750.00 2,750.00 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 1,500.00 1,500.00 1,600.00 1,600.00 1,108.13 1,108.13
604 |Reconstruct Storm Inlet, as per plan 4 EACH 1,250.00 | $  5,000.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 650.00 [$  2,600.00 600.00 2,400.00 750.00 3,000.00 1,950.00 7,800.00 550.00 | $ 2,200.00 1,500.00 6,000.00 600.00 2,400.00 453.34 1,813.36
604 |Reconstruct/Adjust Manhole to Grade 3 EACH 450.00 | $  1,350.00 300.00 900.00 675.00 [$  2,025.00 1,060.00 3,180.00 250.00 750.00 700.00 2,100.00 335.00 [ $ 1,005.00 1,250.00 3,750.00 550.00 1,650.00 455.82 1,367.46
608 |Curb Ramp 5 EACH 300.00 [$ 1,500.00 390.00 1,950.00 567.00 [$ 2,835.00 276.00 1,380.00 350.00 [$ 1,750.00 1,585.00 7,925.00 210.00 [ $ 1,050.00 500.00 2,500.00 370.00 1,850.00 250.00 1,250.00
608 |Concrete Walk 4", 5' Walk (Residential Mainline) 6,751 S.F. 3.10 | $ 20,928.10 4.15 28,016.65 5.00 | $ 33,755.00 5.50 37,130.50 3.00 | $ 20,253.00 5.50 37,130.50 289 |$ 19,510.39 5.00 33,755.00 3.75 25,316.25 3.03 20,455.53
608 |Concrete Walk 6", 5' Walk (Residential Drives) 605 S.F. 410 [$ 2,480.50 6.25 3,781.25 10.00 | $  6,050.00 6.20 3,751.00 4.00 2,420.00 6.45 3,902.25 346 | $ 2,093.30 6.00 3,630.00 4.25 2,571.25 3.73 2,256.65
609 |Curb & Gutter, as per plan 1,706 L.F. 11.00 | $ 18,766.00 11.00 18,766.00 12.00 | $ 20,472.00 11.50 19,619.00 12.00 20,472.00 28.50 48,621.00 9.73|$ 16,599.38 16.00 27,296.00 10.00 17,060.00 8.98 15,319.88
614  |Maintenance of Traffic 1 LUMP $  4,000.00 7,300.00 7,300.00 7,000.00 | $  7,000.00 8,300.00 8,300.00 12,500.00 12,500.00 14,830.00 14,830.00 11,571.02 [$ 11,571.02 14,000.00 14,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00
Spec _|Audio/Video Recording of Construction Corridor 1 LUMP $ 1,500.00 4,000.00 4,000.00 3,000.00 [$  3,000.00 2,450.00 2,450.00 850.00 | $ 850.00 1,125.00 1,125.00 500.26 | $ 500.26 1,500.00 1,500.00 925.00 925.00 951.27 951.27

Total Subtotal $ 168,212.35 229,571.20 $ 199,989.00 215,429.00 $ 184,217.00 282,637.15 $ 189,988.00 234,971.00 184,127.00 163,828.78

Amount as Bid $ 168,212.35 $ 229,571.20 $ 204,489.00 $ 215,429.00 $ 184,217.00 $ 282,637.15 $ 189,988.00 $ 234,971.00 $ 184,127.00 $ 163,828.78

Difference $ - $ - $  (4,500.00) $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -

MBE SUPPLIER, Items for Unit Price Bid (Pipe Only) CA Shindeldecker R.A. Miller NO BID NO BID W.G. Stang NO BID NO BID NO BID C.G. Construction & Utilities Prograde Excavation
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT | UNIT COST| TOTAL COST | UNIT COST [ TOTAL COST [ UNIT COST| TOTAL COST [ UNIT COST| TOTAL COST | UNIT COST | TOTAL COST | UNIT COST [ TOTAL COST | UNIT COST [ TOTAL COST | UNIT COST | TOTAL COST| UNIT COST | TOTAL COST| UNIT COST | TOTAL COST
603 6" Storm Sewer HDPE (Pipe Only) 45 L.F. $ 225($%$ 101.25 2.12 95.40 | $ = = $ = = $ 4.00 180.00 | $ 2 o $ ° $ - $ 2 = $ 3.50 157.50 | $ 241 108.45
603 12" Storm Sewer HDPE (Pipe Only) 37 L.F. $ 535($% 197.95 5.19 192.03 [ $ - = $ = = $ 8.00 296.00 | $ = = $ ° $ ° $ ° = $ 7.50 27750 | $ 5.87 217.19
603 12" Storm Sewer RCP CL-IV (Pipe Only) 210 L.F. $ 1050 | $ 2,205.00 8.52 1,789.20 | $ - = $ = = $ 12.50 2,625.00 | $ = = $ ° $ ° $ ° = $ 12.50 2,625.00 | $ 11.38 2,389.80

Total Subtotal $ 2,504.20 2,076.63 = - 3,101.00 = $ = = 3,060.00 2,715.44

Amount as Bid $ 2,504.20 $ 2,076.63 $  3,101.00 $  3,060.00 $ 271544

Difference $ = $ = $ = $ = $ =
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